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The English Society of SLC, Litworms, orchestrated an 

inspiring article writing competition on the occasion 

of Independence Day, centering on the theme 

"Evolving Identity: The Journey of a Nation Since 

Independence” from 11th to 15th August, 2023. This 

event not only celebrated the nation's freedom but 

also provided a platform for students to reflect on the 

dynamic evolution of India since its emancipation 

from colonial rule. 
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The event saw an enthusiastic response, with 50 
students registering for the competition. Out of these, 
30 participants submitted their articles, each bringing 
their unique perspective to the theme. The theme, 
"Evolving Identity: The Journey of a Nation Since 
Independence," invited students to analyze and 
articulate the socio-political, economic, and cultural 
changes that have shaped modern India. 

 
Students from various disciplines and colleges eagerly 
participated, bringing diverse perspectives and 
insights to the competition. After reviewing these 
articles, the winners were announced. Navni Sharma 
from Maitreyi College, secured first place. Arpita 
Khanduja from Shyam Lal College(M) won second 
place. The third place was awarded to Anvesha Batra 
from SSCBS. 

 
Overall, the article writing competition on 
Independence Day was a resounding success, offering 
a platform for students to express their thoughts and 
insights on the evolution of India's identity since 
independence. It was a celebration of India's past 
achievements, present challenges, and future 
aspirations, reflecting the collective consciousness of a 
nation in perpetual motion. 


